

Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
204000310	"BEND - PVC 45 X 3/4" Sch. 40	\$ 0.35	NO BID	\$ 0.44	\$ 0.52
204000320	"BEND - PVC 45 X 1" Sch. 40	\$ 0.40	NO BID	\$ 0.52	\$ 0.63
204000325	"BEND - PVC 45 X 2" Sch. 40	\$ 0.95	NO BID	\$ 1.21	\$ 1.42
204000410	DEEP SOCKET SLIP COUPLING - PVC 3/4" SCH. 40	\$ 0.80	NO BID	\$ 0.48	\$ 0.32
204000420	DEEP SOCKET COUPLING - PVC 1" Schedule 40	\$ 0.85	NO BID	NO BID	\$ 0.59
204000425	2" DEEP SOCKET PVC Coupling sch 40"	\$ 1.35	NO BID	\$ 1.75	\$ 1.37
204000505	TEE - PVC 3/4" SLIP BOTH ENDS SCH 40	\$ 0.20	NO BID	\$ 0.25	\$ 0.29
204000510	"TEE - PVC 1" SLIP BOTH ENDS SCH 40	\$ 0.35	NO BID	\$ 0.46	\$ 0.54
204000530	"TEE - PVC 2" SLIP BOTH ENDS SCH 40	\$ 1.00	NO BID	\$ 1.28	\$ 1.50
204000610	"ELL - PVC 90 X 3/4 " SLIP BOTH ENDS SCH 40	\$ 0.15	NO BID	\$ 0.19	\$ 0.23
204000620	"ELL - PVC 90 X 1" SLIP BOTH ENDS SCH 40	\$ 0.30	NO BID	\$ 0.35	\$ 0.40
204000630	"ELL - PVC 90 X 2" SLIP BOTH ENDS SCH 40	\$ 0.80	NO BID	\$ 1.03	\$ 1.22
204000650	"MALE ADAPTER PVC 3/4" SLIP X MPT SCH 40	\$ 0.15	NO BID	\$ 0.17	\$ 0.19
204000665	"MALE ADAPTER PVC 1" SLIP X MPT SCH 40	\$ 0.25	NO BID	\$ 0.31	\$ 0.33
204000670	"MALE ADAPTER PVC 2" SLIP X MPT SCH 40	\$ 0.50	NO BID	\$ 0.67	\$ 0.70
204000690	"FEMALE ADAPTER - PVC 3/4" SLIP X FPT SCH. 80	\$ 1.70	NO BID	\$ 2.23	\$ 2.27
204000700	"FEMALE ADAPTER - PVC 1" SLIP X FPT Schedule 80	\$ 2.50	NO BID	\$ 3.29	\$ 3.02
204000720	"FEMALE ADAPTER - PVC 2"" SLIP X FPT" SCH. 80	\$ 8.70	NO BID	\$ 11.41	\$ 11.59
204000725	NIPPLE- PVC SCH- 80 2" X 12"	\$ 3.60	NO BID	\$ 4.07	\$ 4.08
205000100	STEEL COUPLING 1/2""	\$ 17.80	NO BID	\$ 16.93	\$ 17.65
205000110	STEEL COUPLING 3/4" PIPE O.D. 1.05" LENGTH 4 1/2" TO 5"	\$ 20.50	NO BID	\$ 19.37	\$ 19.27
205000120	STEEL COUPLING 1" PIPE O.D. 1.32" LENGTH 4 1/2" TO 5"	\$ 21.00	NO BID	\$ 20.04	\$ 20.99
205000130	STEEL COUPLING 1 1/2" PIPE O.D. 1.90" LENGTH 5"	\$ 26.40	NO BID	\$ 25.05	\$ 24.49
205000140	STEEL COUPLING 2" PIPE O.D. 2.38 LENGTH 5"	\$ 40.40	NO BID	\$ 28.39	\$ 31.79
205000163	"COUPLING 4"" hymax couplings	\$ 160.00	NO BID	\$ 132.34	\$ 114.88
205000165	"COUPLING 6"" hymax couplings	\$ 205.00	NO BID	\$ 174.73	\$ 151.65
205000170	"COUPLING 8"" hymax couplings	\$ 278.00	NO BID	\$ 197.86	\$ 171.75
205000175	"COUPLING 12"" hymax couplings	\$ 545.00	NO BID	\$ 366.61	\$ 260.83
206000500	CLAMP-COLLAR LEAK 2 X 7 1/2 OD 2.38	\$ 42.50	NO BID	\$ 40.36	\$ 33.90
206000530	CLAMP-COLLAR LEAK 4 X 7 1/2 o.d. range 4.50	\$ 54.80	NO BID	\$ 52.05	\$ 44.50
206000532	4" X 7 1/2" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 4.44-5.24	\$ 69.00	NO BID	\$ 65.40	\$ 58.80
206000540	2" X 7 1/2" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (SINGLE BAND) O.D. 2.35 - 2.63	\$ 37.20	NO BID	\$ 35.34	\$ 27.65
206000553	3" X 7 1/2" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 3.49 - 4.29	\$ 63.80	NO BID	\$ 60.60	\$ 28.65

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_

Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
206000555	3" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 3.49 - 4.29	\$ 125.30	NO BID	\$ 97.91	\$ 53.30
206000580	4" X 7 1/2" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 4.74-5.57	\$ 70.50	NO BID	\$ 66.96	\$ 58.80
206000582	4" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 4.44-5.24	\$ 136.00	NO BID	\$ 129.49	\$ 107.75
206000585	4" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 4.74 - 5.57	\$ 140.00	NO BID	\$ 133.20	\$ 107.75
206000592	6" X 7 1/2" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 6.62- 7.42	\$ 80.00	NO BID	\$ 76.12	\$ 68.15
206000593	8" X 7 1/2" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 8.62 - 9.42	\$ 90.50	NO BID	\$ 86.03	\$ 77.75
206000594	12" X 10" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 12.75-13.55	\$ 171.40	NO BID	\$ 162.79	\$ 115.64
206000595	6" X 7 1/2" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 6.84-7.64	\$ 81.70	NO BID	\$ 77.69	\$ 68.15
206000596	8" X 7 1/2" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 8.99 -9.79	\$ 92.50	NO BID	\$ 87.87	\$ 77.75
206000598	6" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (BOUBLE BAND) O.D. 6.62 - 7.42	\$ 158.75	NO BID	\$ 150.77	\$ 122.25
206000599	12" X 10" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 13.65 - 14.45	\$ 175.30	NO BID	\$ 166.49	\$ 115.64
206000600	6" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 6.84 -7.64	\$ 159.00	NO BID	\$ 150.97	\$ 122.21
206000617	8" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 8.62 - 9.42	\$ 179.00	NO BID	\$ 170.17	\$ 130.40
206000620	8" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 8.99 - 9.79	\$ 180.00	NO BID	\$ 171.67	\$ 130.40
206000627	10" X 10" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 10.75 - 11.55	\$ 152.00	NO BID	\$ 145.22	\$ 103.05
206000632	10" X 10" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 11.60 - 12.40	\$ 163.00	NO BID	\$ 155.38	\$ 103.05
206000650	10" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 10.75 - 11.55	\$ 228.00	NO BID	\$ 217.36	\$ 146.33
206000655	10" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 11.60 - 12.40	\$ 243.00	NO BID	\$ 231.23	\$ 146.33
206000668	12" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 12.75 -13.55	\$ 256.00	NO BID	\$ 243.53	\$ 146.95
206000690	12" X 15" FULL CIRCLE CLAMP (DOUBLE BAND) O.D. 13.65-14.45	\$ 261.00	NO BID	\$ 247.87	\$ 146.95
207000230	TAP SADDLE 2 X 3/4	\$ 11.85	NO BID	\$ 16.06	\$ 13.20
207000250	TAP SADDLE 2 X 1	\$ 11.85	NO BID	\$ 16.06	\$ 13.20
207000320	TAP SADDLE 3 X 3/4	\$ 15.80	NO BID	\$ 21.19	\$ 17.36
207000330	TAP SADDLE 3 X 1	\$ 15.80	NO BID	\$ 21.19	\$ 17.36
207000350	TAP SADDLE 4 X 3/4 O.D. 4.74 - 5.32 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 52.65	NO BID	\$ 64.95	\$ 58.30
207000360	TAP SADDLE 4 X 1 O.D. 4.74 - 5.32 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 52.65	NO BID	\$ 64.95	\$ 58.30
207000390	TAP SADDLE 6 X 3/4 O.D. 6.84 - 7.45 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 62.10	NO BID	\$ 76.49	\$ 68.67
207000420	TAP SADDLE 6 X 1 O.D. 6.84 - 7.45 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 62.10	NO BID	\$ 76.49	\$ 68.67
207000440	TAP SADDLE 6 X 2 O.D. 6.84 - 7.45 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 78.20	NO BID	\$ 96.15	\$ 86.25
207000490	TAP SADDLE 8 X 3/4 O.D. 8.99 - 9.67 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 77.40	NO BID	\$ 94.70	\$ 84.98
207000500	TAP SADDLE 8 X 1 O.D. 8.99 - 9.67 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 77.40	NO BID	\$ 94.70	\$ 84.98
207000520	TAP SADDLE 8 X 2 O.D. 8.99 - 9.67 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 88.45	NO BID	\$ 108.65	\$ 97.40
207000540	TAP SADDLE 12 X 3/4 O.D. 13.14 - 14.58 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 108.45	NO BID	\$ 137.33	\$ 123.20

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_

Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
207000550	TAP SADDLE 12 X 1 O.D. 13.14 - 14.58 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 108.45	NO BID	\$ 137.33	\$ 123.20
207000560	TAP SADDLE 12 X 2 O.D. 13.14 - 14.58 DOUBLE BAND	\$ 124.45	NO BID	\$ 157.72	\$ 141.45
209000120	"CORPORATION 3/4" COMPRESSION F1000-3"	\$ 15.25	NO BID	\$ 17.17	\$ 17.35
209000130	"CORPORATION 1" C TO I COMPRESSION F-1000-4"	\$ 23.50	NO BID	\$ 25.96	\$ 26.25
210000120	"CURB STOP IRON TO IRON 3/4" B11-333W"	\$ 24.60	NO BID	\$ 29.86	\$ 27.77
210000130	"CURB STOP COPPER TO IRON 3/4" COMPRESSION" B-41-233W	\$ 18.35	NO BID	\$ 30.89	\$ 20.69
210000135	3/4" BALL CURB STOP VALVE, PAD WING WITH 3/4" FLARE COPPER BY 3/4" FEMALE IRON PIPE THREAD	\$ 18.00	NO BID	\$ 32.27	\$ 19.50
210000150	"CURB STOP IRON TO IRON 1"	\$ 36.80	NO BID	\$ 42.08	\$ 42.54
210000160	"CURB STOP COPPER TO IRON 1" COMPRESSION" B41-444W	\$ 41.00	NO BID	\$ 46.85	\$ 47.36
211000150	"3/4" BRASS FIPT COUPLING"	\$ 2.60	NO BID	\$ 2.18	\$ 2.42
211000300	BUSHING TAPPER 1 X 3/4 BRASS	\$ 5.10	NO BID	\$ 21.66	\$ 7.46
211000309	BUSHING BRASS 3/4 X 1/2	\$ 1.70	NO BID	\$ 1.44	\$ 1.56
211000310	BUSHING - BRASS 1 X 3/4	\$ 2.60	NO BID	\$ 2.18	\$ 2.42
211000311	1 1/2 X 1 BRASS BUSHING	\$ 5.60	NO BID	\$ 4.73	\$ 5.27
211000315	"BUSHING - BRASS 2 X 1 1/2"	\$ 8.25	NO BID	\$ 7.00	\$ 7.75
211000400	TEE - BRASS 3/4 FIPT	\$ 3.70	NO BID	\$ 3.30	\$ 3.65
211000410	"TEE - BRASS 1" FIPT	\$ 6.50	NO BID	\$ 5.86	\$ 6.50
211000420	"TEE - BRASS 2" FIPT	\$ 20.65	NO BID	\$ 18.53	\$ 20.50
211000500	NIPPLE - BRASS 3/4 X 4 MIPT	\$ 3.40	NO BID	\$ 3.28	\$ 3.50
211000505	3/4 X 6 BRS. NIPPLE MIPT	\$ 5.00	NO BID	\$ 4.79	\$ 5.04
211000510	NIPPLE - BRASS 1 X 4 MIPT	\$ 4.95	NO BID	\$ 4.75	\$ 4.93
211000520	NIPPLE - BRASS 1 1/2 X 4 MIPT	\$ 8.70	NO BID	\$ 8.34	\$ 8.52
211000530	NIPPLE - BRASS 1 1/2 X 6 MIPT	\$ 12.85	NO BID	\$ 12.31	\$ 12.63
211000540	NIPPLE - BRASS 2 X 4 MIPT	\$ 11.20	NO BID	\$ 10.73	\$ 11.00
211000550	NIPPLE - BRASS 2 X 6 MIPT	\$ 16.50	NO BID	\$ 15.83	\$ 16.15
211000555	BRASS 90 ELL FIP 3/4" FIPT	\$ 3.00	NO BID	\$ 2.69	\$ 2.99
211000560	BRASS 90 ELL FIP 1" FIPT	\$ 4.60	NO BID	\$ 4.14	\$ 4.59
211000565	BRASS COUPLING FIPT 1"	\$ 3.90	NO BID	\$ 3.30	\$ 3.67
212000567	BEND BRASS 2" X 90 FIP	\$ 14.90	NO BID	\$ 13.39	\$ 14.89
211000575	BRASS COUPLING FIPT 2"	\$ 13.60	NO BID	\$ 11.53	\$ 12.79
212000110	ADAPTERS-BRASS C84-33 3/4" COMP X 3/4" MIPT	\$ 7.15	NO BID	\$ 7.68	\$ 7.78
212000300	"ADAPTERS BRASS 1" MPT X COMP."	\$ 8.45	NO BID	\$ 9.10	\$ 9.21
212000310	"ADAPTERS 1" FPT X COMP."	\$ 10.20	NO BID	\$ 10.71	\$ 11.10

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_

Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
212000515	"U-BRANCH 1" X 3/4" X 71/2" CMP X MIP U48-43"	\$ 19.60	NO BID	\$ 23.08	\$ 23.35
212000555	"3/4" x 90" BRASS COMP BEND L44-33"	\$ 11.25	NO BID	\$ 12.10	\$ 12.23
212000565	"1" x 90 BRASS COMP. BEND" L-44-44	\$ 14.45	NO BID	\$ 15.54	\$ 15.72
212000600	"COUPLING - BRASS 1/2" COMP. C44-11"	\$ 8.50	NO BID	\$ 9.77	\$ 9.68
212000610	"BRASS 3/4" COMP.COUP. C-44-33"	\$ 8.70	NO BID	\$ 9.36	\$ 9.50
212000620	"BRASS 1" COMP.COUP.C-44-44"	\$ 9.95	NO BID	\$ 10.71	\$ 10.90
212000630	"BRASS 3/4" FEMALE COMP.COUP. C-14-33"	\$ 7.50	NO BID	\$ 18.08	\$ 8.19
212000635	L44-77 2" PJ (CTS) X PJ (CTS) BRASS 90 ELL	\$ 85.80	NO BID	\$ 92.28	\$ 93.25
212000640	C84-77 2" PJ(CTS) X MIP BRASS MALE ADAPTER FORD BRASS OR EQUAL	\$ 30.90	NO BID	\$ 33.22	\$ 33.59
212000645	C14-77 2" PJ(CTS) X FIP BRASS FEMALE ADAPTER	\$ 32.30	NO BID	\$ 34.72	\$ 35.10
212000650	2" COUPLING PACK JOINT BY PACK JOINT FOR COPPER OR PLASTIC TUBING (CTS) TO PVC PIPE (PVC)	\$ 45.90	NO BID	\$ 52.59	\$ 53.15
213000200	"METER FLANGE 1 1/2" BRASS	\$ 42.00	NO BID	\$ 20.31	\$ 20.54
213000210	"METER FLANGE 2" BRASS	\$ 52.90	NO BID	\$ 26.52	\$ 26.80
213000219	1 1/2" DROP IN METER GASKETS	\$ 20.50	NO BID	\$ 1.45	\$ 1.75
213000220	2" DROP IN GASKETS FOR METER FLANGE	\$ 19.50	NO BID	\$ 1.65	\$ 1.91
213000300	METER RISER 1/2 X 7 V41-7W	\$ 43.70	NO BID	\$ 44.12	\$ 44.65
213000320	METER RISER 3/4 X 7 V42-7W	\$ 45.40	NO BID	\$ 46.01	\$ 46.99
213000330	METER RISER 3/4 X 9 V42-9W	\$ 45.90	NO BID	\$ 46.59	\$ 47.50
213000340	METER RISER 3/4 X 12 V42-12W	\$ 47.40	NO BID	\$ 48.22	\$ 59.45
213000360	METER RISER 1 X 10 V44-10W	\$ 94.00	NO BID	\$ 87.86	\$ 88.80
213000370	METER RISER 1 X 12 V44-12W	\$ 95.90	NO BID	\$ 89.94	\$ 90.88
213000410	"STRAIGHT METER COUPLING 3/4" BRASS" C38-23-2.5 OR EQUAL	\$ 3.70	NO BID	\$ 4.99	\$ 5.07
213000420	"METER COUPLING 1" BRASS" C38-44-2.625	\$ 4.75	NO BID	\$ 7.68	\$ 7.75
214000102	ANGLE STOP 3/4 COMPRESSION KV 43-332W	\$ 18.30	NO BID	\$ 20.40	\$ 20.60
214000103	BFA43-777W 2" ANGLE BALL METER VALVE FLANGE X PJ (CTS)	\$ 136.70	NO BID	\$ 116.40	\$ 157.95
214000130	"ANGLE STOP 1" BRASS"	N/A	NO BID	\$ 27.93	\$ 28.20
214000140	"ANGLE STOP 1" COMPRESSION KV 43-444W"	\$ 52.35	NO BID	\$ 27.93	\$ 28.20
215000100	"BALL VALVE 1 1/2" # B11-666W	\$ 71.50	NO BID	\$ 77.84	\$ 78.65
215000110	"BALL VALVE 2" IRON TO IRON PIPE THREAD W/L" B11-777W	\$ 105.40	NO BID	\$ 113.35	\$ 114.50
216000151	"GATE VALVE 4" MJ X MJ" LESS/ACC. LEFT	\$ 265.00	\$ 265.00	\$ 302.91	\$ 292.46
216000160	"GATE VALVE 6" MJ X MJ LESS/ACC. LEFT	\$ 335.00	\$ 341.00	\$ 386.40	\$ 384.67
216000170	"GATE VALVE 8" MJ X MJ LESS/ACC. LEFT	\$ 535.00	\$ 530.00	\$ 615.48	\$ 612.75

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_

Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
216000180	"GATE VALVE 10"" MJ X MJ LESS/ACC. LEFT	\$ 835.00	\$ 843.00	\$ 959.10	\$ 954.80
216000190	"GATE VALVE 12"" MJ X MJ LESS/ACC. LEFT	\$ 1,055.00	\$ 1,044.00	\$ 1,214.40	\$ 1,208.25
217000120	"TAPPING VALVE 4" MJ X TAP LEFT	\$ 350.00	\$ 265.00	\$ 289.11	\$ 380.55
217000130	"TAPPING VALVE 6" MJ X TAP LEFT	\$ 470.00	\$ 341.00	\$ 386.40	\$ 537.17
217000140	"TAPPING VALVE 8" MJ X TAP LEFT	\$ 695.00	\$ 530.00	\$ 603.75	\$ 797.50
	TAPPING VALVE 10" MJ X TAP LEFT	\$ 1,060.00	\$ 843.00	\$ 959.10	\$ 1,202.00
	TAPPING VALVE 12" MJ X TAP LEFT	\$ 1,585.00	\$ 1,044.00	\$ 1,158.51	\$ 1,816.00
221000100	"ANCHOR COUPLING 4" X 12" MJ COMPACT LESS ACC.	\$ 237.00	NO BID	\$ 21.00	\$ 31.25
221000200	"ANCHOR COUPLING 6" X 12" MJ COMPACT	\$ 155.00	NO BID	\$ 75.25	\$ 43.41
221000210	"6" ANCHOR COUP.SPLIT RING"	\$ 50.00	NO BID	\$ 24.79	\$ 18.75
221000260	ANCHOR COUPLING 8" X 12" MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 208.00	NO BID	\$ 121.80	\$ 56.81
221000300	"ANCHOR COUPLING 12" X 12" MJ COMACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 624.00	NO BID	\$ 136.74	\$ 92.25
222000310	4" MJ BEND 90° ELL LESS ACC.	\$ 28.50	NO BID	\$ 31.50	\$ 28.75
222000400	"BEND 6" 11 1/4^ MJ COMAPCT, LESS ACC.	\$ 38.85	NO BID	\$ 43.05	\$ 39.26
222000410	"BEND 6" 22 1/2^ MJ COMAPCT, LESS ACC.	\$ 40.75	NO BID	\$ 45.15	\$ 41.15
222000420	"BEND 6" 45^ MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 39.50	NO BID	\$ 43.75	\$ 39.90
222000430	"BEND 6" 90^ MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 45.50	NO BID	\$ 50.40	\$ 45.96
222000490	"BEND 8" X 11 1/4^ MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 59.40	NO BID	\$ 65.80	\$ 59.37
222000500	"BEND 8" 22 1/2^ MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 62.00	NO BID	\$ 68.60	\$ 61.90
222000510	"BEND 8" 45^ MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 61.30	NO BID	\$ 67.90	\$ 61.27
222000530	"BEND 8" 90^ MJ COMPACT, LESS / ACC.	\$ 70.75	NO BID	\$ 78.40	\$ 70.75
222000600	"BEND 10" 45^ MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 83.70	NO BID	\$ 92.75	\$ 82.82
222000730	"BEND 12" 11 1/4^ MJ COMAPCT, LESS ACC.	\$ 112.50	NO BID	\$ 124.60	\$ 112.40
222000740	"BEND 12" 22 1/2^ MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 115.60	NO BID	\$ 128.10	\$ 114.00
222000750	"BEND 12" 45^ MJ COMAPCT, LESS ACC.	\$ 115.30	NO BID	\$ 127.75	\$ 114.00
222000760	"BEND 12" 90^ MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 142.50	NO BID	\$ 157.85	\$ 140.00
223000200	"SOLID SLEEVE 4" X 12" MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 27.80	NO BID	\$ 30.80	\$ 28.09
223000300	SOLID SLEEVE 6" X 7 1/2" MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 29.00	NO BID	\$ 32.20	\$ 28.75
223000310	"SOLID SLEEVE 6" X 12" MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 43.00	NO BID	\$ 47.60	\$ 43.45
223000400	SOLID SLEEVE 8" X 7 1/2" MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 39.30	NO BID	\$ 43.40	\$ 38.75
223000401	8" X 12" SOLID SLEEVE MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 56.20	NO BID	\$ 62.30	\$ 56.85
223000510	SOLID SLEEVE 10" X 12" MJ COMPACT LESS ACC.	\$ 67.60	NO BID	\$ 74.90	\$ 67.58
223000600	SOLID SLEEVE 12" X 12" MJ COMPACT, LESS ACC.	\$ 91.30	NO BID	\$ 101.15	\$ 91.27

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_

Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
224000129	TEE 6X6MJX6 ANCHOR LESS/ACC. DOMESTIC ONLY	\$ 186.00	NO BID	\$ 108.50	\$ 150.00
224000130	TEE 6X6X6 MJ X MJ LESS ACC.	\$ 63.00	NO BID	\$ 69.65	\$ 63.55
224000132	TEE 8X8X8 MJ X MJ LESS ACC.	\$ 94.50	NO BID	\$ 104.65	\$ 94.45
224000133	TEE 8X8X6 MJ X ANCHOR ( LESS/ACC. ) DOMESTIC ONLY	\$ 231.00	NO BID	\$ 135.10	\$ 188.95
224000136	8X8X6 MJ TEE LESS ACC.	\$ 86.50	NO BID	\$ 95.90	\$ 85.63
224000140	TEE 12X6 MJ X MJ LESS ACC.	\$ 146.50	NO BID	\$ 162.40	\$ 145.00
224000145	TEE 12X12X6 MJ ANCHOR N ( LESS ACC. ) DOMESTIC ONLY	\$ 391.00	NO BID	\$ 228.55	\$ 313.00
224000151	TEE 12 X 12 X 8 M. J. ( LESS/ACC. ) DOMESTIC ONLY	\$ 305.00	NO BID	\$ 179.55	\$ 245.90
224000160	TEE 12 X 12.X 12 M. J. ( LESS / ACC. ) DOMESTIC ONLY	\$ 371.00	NO BID	\$ 216.65	\$ 296.75
228000100	"SCH-40 PVC PIPE 1/2" BELLED JOINT	\$ 0.30	NO BID	\$0.19	\$0.25
228000110	"SCH-40 PVC PIPE 3/4" BELLED JOINT	\$ 0.35	NO BID	\$0.27	\$0.30
228000120	"SCH-40 PVC PIPE 1" BELLED JOINT	\$ 0.50	NO BID	\$0.41	\$0.40
228000130	SCH 40 PVC PIPE 1 1/2" BELLED JOINT	\$ 0.80	NO BID	\$0.60	\$0.44
228000140	"SCH-40 PVC PIPE 2" BELL JOINT ( WELL CASEING)	\$ 0.95	NO BID	\$0.80	\$0.60
228000300	"SDR18 6"" PVC WATER PIPE C-909 CLASS-150 GASKET JOINT	\$ 4.40	NO BID	\$4.69	\$3.59
228000310	"SDR18 8"" PVC WATER PIPE C-909 ULTRA BLUE GASKET JOINT CLASS 150	\$ 7.60	NO BID	\$8.14	\$6.20
228000320	"SDR18 12""PVC WATER PIPE C-909 CLASS 150 GASKET JOINT	\$ 16.15	NO BID	\$17.06	\$13.21
229000120	"DUCTILE IRON PIPE 6"	\$ 16.25	NO BID	\$17.14	call for price
229000130	"DUCTILE IRON PIPE 8"	\$ 22.40	NO BID	\$21.38	call for price
229000140	"DUCTILE IRON PIPE 10"	\$ 29.70	NO BID	\$27.59	call for price
229000150	"DUCTILE IRON PIPE 12"	\$ 37.90	NO BID	\$28.76	call for price
229000160	"DUCTILE IRON PIPE 14"	\$ 47.40	NO BID	\$41.68	call for price
235000110	"COPPER TUBING 3/4""X 60"" K-SOFT (ROLLS)	\$ 390.00	NO BID	\$186.00	\$ 162.00
235000120	"COPPER TUBING 3/4"" X 100"" K-SOFT (ROLLS)	\$ 650.00	NO BID	\$310.00	\$ 270.00
235000130	"COPPER TUBING 1"" x 60"" K-SOFT ( ROLLS)	\$ 498.00	NO BID	\$243.00	\$ 216.60
235000140	"COPPER TUBING 1"" x 100"" K-SOFT ( ROLLS )	\$ 830.00	NO BID	\$406.00	\$ 361.00
235000150	2" TYPE "L" HARD COPPER (20 FT JOINT)	\$ 340.00	NO BID	\$159.80	\$ 200.00
236000100	VALVE BOX 19"- 21" WITH LID	\$ 30.50	NO BID	\$ 29.07	\$ 32.96
236000110	VALVE BOX 27" - 37" WITH LID	\$ 41.00	NO BID	\$ 41.98	\$ 44.35
236000120	VALVE BOX 39" - 50" WITH LID	\$ 50.50	NO BID	\$ 50.81	\$ 54.55
	"WATER" LID ONLY FOR VALVE BOXES LISTED ABOVE	\$ 10.00	NO BID	\$ 7.67	\$ 11.50
236000130	VALVE BOXES 36 X 60 WITH LID	\$ 71.60	NO BID	\$ 72.00	\$ 77.28

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_

Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
237000090	"RISER 1 1/2"" VALVE BOX" RISER WITH LID FOR BOXES LISTED ABOVE	\$ 8.50	NO BID	\$ 8.72	\$ 9.10
237000100	"RISER 2"" VALVE BOX RISER" FOR BOXES LISTED ABOVE	\$ 9.00	NO BID	\$ 11.16	\$ 9.15
237000110	"RISER 3"" - 5"" VALVE BOX RISER" TYLER = # 69	\$ 15.00	NO BID	\$ 24.19	\$ 25.00
242000110	CHEMICALS - 1/2 PINT = 8 FL. OZ TEFLON - ENRICHED ----- THREAD SEALANT	\$ 13.50	NO BID	\$ 7.16	\$ 7.50
	PURPLE PRIMER 32 OZ.	\$ 11.85	NO BID	\$ 11.38	\$ 5.60
242000130	32 OZ. PVC HD GRAY CEMENT FAST SET.	\$ 13.75	NO BID	\$ 12.75	\$ 9.80
242000180	PIPE JOINT LUBRICANT (2 LBS. CONTAINER)	\$ 5.50	NO BID	\$ 3.20	\$ 3.25
243000100	METER BOX LID - SMALL PVC ( FITS D-1200 BOXES ) WITH READER LID	\$ 5.20	NO BID	\$ 7.31	\$ 11.40
243000102	METER BOX LID - PVC LARGE D1500 WITH READER LID	\$ 8.60	NO BID	\$ 17.95	\$ 19.60
243000105	METER BOX LID - SMALL (METAL) WITH READER	\$ 27.00	NO BID	\$ 19.50	\$ 28.50
243000106	METER BOX LID - LARGE (METAL) 2 PIECE	\$ 73.00	NO BID	\$ 73.14	\$ 74.50
243000110	METER BOX - SMALL CONCRETE	\$ 12.70	NO BID	\$ 17.86	\$ 13.50
243000111	SMALL METER BOX LID - CONCRETE WITH C.I. READER LID	\$ 16.65	NO BID	\$ 17.86	\$ 17.65
	LARGE METER BOX LID - CONCRETE WITH C.I. READER LID	\$ 32.00	NO BID	\$ 41.06	\$ 33.80
243000120	METER BOX - SMALL PVC D-1200 WITH METER READER LID	\$ 10.40	NO BID	\$ 12.99	\$ 12.32
243000130	METER BOX - LARGE PVC #D1500- DIRB JUMBO PLASTIC METER BOX, DROP IN READER METER PLASTIC WITH PLASTIC METER COVER. 13" X 20" X 12"	\$ 23.20	NO BID	\$ 35.24	\$ 20.85
243000140	METER BOX - LARGE CONCRETE ( WITH READER LID C.I. )	\$ 57.80	NO BID	\$ 77.22	\$ 61.23
247000114	12X2 MJ CAP OR PLUG	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 71.75	\$ 64.00
247000200	4" CAP OR PLUG	\$ 29.00	NO BID	\$ 12.65	\$ 12.45
247000211	6X2 CAP OR PLUG	\$ 30.00	NO BID	\$ 32.90	\$ 30.00
247000212	8X2 CAP OR PLUG	\$ 40.00	NO BID	\$ 44.45	\$ 40.54
247000590	4" MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT FOR C-909 WATER PIPE (MEGA LUG ONLY)	\$ 19.50	NO BID	\$ 21.44	\$ 19.88
247000600	6" MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT FOR C-909 WATER PIPE (MEGA LUG ONLY)	\$ 23.50	NO BID	\$ 24.94	\$ 24.10
247000615	8" MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT FOR C-909 PIPE (MEGA LUG ONLY)	\$ 35.30	NO BID	\$ 37.19	\$ 35.64
247000626	12" MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT FOR C-909 WATER PIPE (MEGA LUG ONLY)	\$ 70.20	NO BID	\$ 73.94	\$ 70.78
247000605	6" MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT FOR FOR D.I. PIPE" ( MEGA LUG )	\$ 19.00	NO BID	\$ 19.69	\$ 19.10
247000610	8" MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. PIPE (MEGA LUG ONLY)	\$ 28.80	NO BID	\$ 30.63	\$ 29.37

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_

Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
247000625	12" MECHANICAL JOINT RESTRAINT FOR D.I. PIPE (MEGA LUG ONLY)	\$ 62.00	NO BID	\$ 65.19	\$ 63.27
247000628	4" MJ GLAND PACK (TRANSITION GLAND PACK)	\$ 10.00	NO BID	\$ 10.68	\$ 10.77
247000629	4" MJ GLAND PACK	\$ 9.50	NO BID	\$ 10.15	\$ 10.25
247000630	6" MJ GLAND PACK	\$ 12.30	NO BID	\$ 12.95	\$ 13.06
247000640	8" MJ GLAND PACK	\$ 15.00	NO BID	\$ 15.75	\$ 15.89
247000650	10" MJ GLAND PACK	\$ 20.00	NO BID	\$ 20.30	\$ 21.18
247000660	12" MJ GLAND PACK	\$ 21.65	NO BID	\$ 22.23	\$ 22.95
247000670	14" GLAND PAC. M.J.& D.I C-150"	\$ 44.00	NO BID	\$ 46.38	\$ 46.75
247000700	4" MJ BOLT AND GASKET PK LESS GLAND	\$ 5.65	NO BID	\$ 5.61	\$ 9.20
247000710	6" MJ BOLT AND GASKET PK. LESS GLAND	\$ 7.85	NO BID	\$ 8.23	\$ 12.75
247000720	8" MJ BOLT AND GASKET PK. LESS GLAND	\$ 8.50	NO BID	\$ 8.93	\$ 13.80
247000730	10" MJ BOLT AND GASKET PK. LESS GLAND	\$ 10.80	NO BID	\$ 11.12	\$ 17.59
247000740	12" MJ BOLT AND GASKET PK. LESS GLAND	\$ 11.30	NO BID	\$ 11.90	\$ 18.40
251000150	"GASKET - TAPPING 6"	\$ 5.00	NO BID	\$ 5.09	\$ 1.30
251000160	"GASKET - TAPPING 8"	\$ 6.00	NO BID	\$ 7.20	\$ 1.75
	GASKET - TAPPING 12"	\$ 10.00	NO BID	\$ 12.04	\$ 4.26
253000100	PROBE ROD 4'	\$ 24.00	NO BID	\$ 22.91	\$ 34.75
253000110	PROBE ROD 5'	\$ 28.00	NO BID	\$ 25.00	\$ 37.06
	GASKET - FLANGED 6"	\$ 2.00	NO BID	\$ 2.00	\$ 2.32
254000130	"GASKET - FLANGED 8"	\$ 2.50	NO BID	\$ 2.15	\$ 2.89
254000140	"GASKET - FLANGED 12"	\$ 4.50	NO BID	\$ 2.70	\$ 4.45
255000110	FIRE HYDRANT 4' BURY STANDARD INLET SIZES	\$ 1,335.00	NO BID	\$ 1,349.72	\$ 1,341.46
255000120	FIRE HYDRANT 5' BURY STANDARD INLET SIZES	\$ 1,400.00	NO BID	\$ 1,412.04	\$ 1,403.36
255000130	FIRE HYDRANT 6' BURY STANDARD INLET SIZES	\$ 1,460.00	NO BID	\$ 1,474.36	\$ 1,466.00
201000200	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS 4"CLAY TO CI/PVC"	\$ 2.75	NO BID	\$ 3.29	\$ 3.05
201000220	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS- 4" PVC TO PVC"	\$ 2.75	NO BID	\$ 3.29	\$ 3.05
201000250	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS- 6" CLAY TO PVC"	\$ 6.00	NO BID	\$ 7.05	\$ 6.45
201000260	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS - 6" PVC TO PVC"	\$ 6.00	NO BID	\$ 7.05	\$ 6.45
201000275	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS 8" PVC TO PVC"	\$ 9.00	NO BID	\$ 10.80	\$ 9.95
201000280	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS- 8" CLAY TO PVC"	\$ 9.00	NO BID	\$ 10.80	\$ 9.95
201000300	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS- 10" CLAY TO PVC"	\$ 12.25	NO BID	\$ 14.64	\$ 14.89
201000325	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS. 12" PVC-PVC"	\$ 14.50	NO BID	\$ 17.48	\$ 17.40
201000340	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS - 12" CLAY TO PVC"	\$ 14.50	NO BID	\$ 17.48	\$ 17.40

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_



Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
201000360	FLEXIBLE COUPLINGS- 15" CLAY TO PVC"	\$ 25.00	NO BID	\$ 30.00	\$ 28.35
204000100	"WYE 6" X 4" SDR 35"	\$ 16.70	NO BID	\$ 12.77	\$ 18.60
204000120	"WYE 8" X 6" SDR 35"	\$ 29.70	NO BID	\$ 32.76	\$ 33.69
204000275	"BEND - PVC DWV 22 1/2 X 4"	\$ 3.70	NO BID	\$ 4.61	\$ 4.96
204000330	4" PVC-DWV 45 BEND SCH 40	\$ 3.85	NO BID	\$ 4.80	\$ 5.45
204000345	BEND PVC 6 X 22 1/2 SDR35	\$ 9.40	NO BID	\$ 9.09	\$ 10.50
204000350	BEND PVC 6 X 45 SDR35 (GASKET JOINT)	\$ 9.70	NO BID	\$ 10.53	\$ 10.80
204000355	BEND 4 X 90 SCH 40 PVC	\$ 5.15	NO BID	\$ 6.32	\$ 6.78
204000360	"BEND PVC 8" X 22 1/2 SDR 35"	\$ 27.35	NO BID	\$ 23.51	\$ 30.50
204000365	"BEND PVC 8" X 45 SDR35"	\$ 27.15	NO BID	\$ 20.32	\$ 30.25
204000442	"4" PVC DWV FEMALE ADAPTER"	\$ 3.00	NO BID	\$ 3.75	\$ 4.05
204000443	"4" PVC-DWV MALE THREAD PLUG	\$ 1.50	NO BID	\$ 1.51	\$ 1.92
204000450	4" PVC-DWV COUPLING	\$ 2.20	NO BID	\$ 2.81	\$ 2.95
204000540	"TEE - PVC 4" SCH 40 DWV	\$ 9.00	NO BID	\$ 9.55	\$ 9.92
204000545	TEE PVC ( TWO WAY CLEANOUT ) 4" X 4" X 4" PVC SCH 40 DWV ( GLUE )	\$ 11.00	NO BID	\$ 15.00	\$ 15.62
204000550	TEE PVC 6X4 SDR 35	\$ 16.20	NO BID	\$ 20.75	\$ 18.10
204000555	TEE PVC 8X4 SDR35 GASKET	\$ 25.00	NO BID	\$ 27.37	\$ 27.96
204000560	"PVC TEE 6" x 6" x 6" SDR 35"	\$ 16.50	NO BID	\$ 27.42	\$ 18.50
204000570	"PVC TEE 8" SDR 35 GASKET JOINT"	\$ 36.50	NO BID	\$ 77.46	\$ 41.00
204000635	PVC BEND 6X90 SDR 35	\$ 11.00	NO BID	\$ 6.92	\$ 12.35
204000638	PVC BEND 8 X 90 SDR 35 GASKET JOINT	\$ 30.50	NO BID	\$ 33.21	\$ 34.10
204000730	"ADAPTOR 4" SCH 40 X 4" SDR 35 HUB ADAPTER" # G924	\$ 12.65	NO BID	\$ 2.04	\$ 2.35
207000105	4" FLEXIBLE SEWER SADDLE TEE WITH 51" STANLESS STEEL BANDS WITH FLIP OUT SCREW # DFW 4 TC T-- PATERN	\$ 27.70	NO BID	\$ 29.90	\$ 30.55
207000106	51" S/S BAND WITH FLIP OUT SCREW	\$ 3.50	NO BID	\$ 4.06	\$ 3.25
228000150	"SCH-40 DWV PVC PIPE 4" BELL JOINT (WELL CASING)	\$ 2.50	NO BID	\$ 2.00	\$1.41
228000200	6" PVC, GASKETED, GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR35 (ASTM D3034) WITH A CELL CLASSIFICATION OF 12454 OR 12364. 14 FT. JOINTS	\$ 2.00	NO BID	\$ 2.26	\$1.48
228000210	8" PVC, GASKETED, GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR 35 (ASTM D3034) WIITH A CELL CLASSIFICATION OF 12454 OR 12364. 14' JOINTS	\$ 3.60	NO BID	\$ 3.44	\$2.67
228000215	10" PVC, GASKETED, GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR35 (ASTM D3034) WITH A CELL CLASSIFICATION OF 12454 OR 12364. 14' JOINT	\$ 5.60	NO BID	\$ 5.40	\$4.19
228000220	12" PVC, GASKETED, GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR35 (ASTM D3034) WITH A CELL CLASSIFICATION OF 12454 OR 12364. 14' JOINT	\$ 8.00	NO BID	\$ 7.75	\$6.01

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_

Stock Code	Description	MDN Enterprises	J&S Valve	HD Supply Waterworks	Municipal Water Works
228000230	15" PVC, GASKETED, GRAVITY SEWER PIPE SDR35 (ASTM D3034) WITH CELL CLASSIFICATION OF 12454 OR 12364. 14' JOINT	\$ 11.90	NO BID	\$ 11.53	\$8.95
238000109	MANHOLE FIBERGLASS 4'	\$ 565.00	NO BID	\$ 667.20	\$ 554.80
238000120	MANHOLE FIBERGLASS 6'	\$ 730.00	NO BID	\$ 872.00	\$ 697.00
238000140	FIBERGLASS MANHOLE 8'	\$ 895.00	NO BID	\$ 1,075.20	\$ 835.00
239000100	"MANHOLE ADJUSTMENT RING VM 42 2""RISER RING" 23 3/4"	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 305.60	\$ 76.25
239000110	"MANHOLE ADJUSTMENT RING V-1918-2 VM 18 2""RISER RING" 23 1/4"	\$ 55.00	NO BID	\$ 88.75	\$ 67.00
239000120	CONCRETE ADJUSTMENT RING 2 X 26	\$ 15.00	NO BID	\$ 29.60	\$ 14.50
241000100	MANHOLE RING 23 1/2" SEWER	\$ 85.00	NO BID	\$ 112.50	\$ 91.50
241000110	MANHOLE LID 23 1/2" SEWER	\$ 89.00	NO BID	\$ 112.50	\$ 85.40
241000120	MANHOLE LID 24" SEWER	\$ 115.00	NO BID	\$ 94.12	\$ 95.00
241000130	MANHOLE RING 24" SEWER	\$ 115.00	NO BID	\$ 84.71	\$ 106.00
242000160	STOP LEAK (HYD. CEMENT)	\$ 36.00	NO BID	\$ 56.29	\$ 29.50
245000100	CLEAN OUT BOOT	\$ 65.00	NO BID	\$ 50.00	\$ 62.50
245000110	CLEAN OUT BOOT LID	\$ 10.00	NO BID	\$ 7.21	\$ 12.50
	PLUG AIR INFLATABLE TEST 4"	\$ 76.50	NO BID	\$ 115.19	\$ 103.00
247000420	PLUG AIR INFLATABLE TEST 6X2 #262-064	\$ 96.80	NO BID	\$ 157.68	\$ 132.00
247000430	PLUG AIR INFLATABLE TEST 8X2 # 262-080	\$ 123.00	NO BID	\$ 198.69	\$ 166.50
247000450	PLUG AIR INFLATABLE TEST 12X2 # 262-129	\$ 226.40	NO BID	\$ 303.40	\$ 308.00
241000160	V-1600-3 REVERSIBLE RING EJIW# 41600310	\$ 92.00	NO BID	\$ 126.67	\$ 125.00
241000170	V-1600-3 STORM COVER EJIW# 41600348	\$ 105.00	NO BID	\$ 133.32	\$ 130.00
241000180	V-3600-3 GRATE (V-3418-1) EJIW# 43600330	\$ 130.00	NO BID	\$ 164.72	\$ 163.00
7010680	" PIPE 12"" ads"	\$ 4.25	NO BID	\$ 5.92	\$7.00
7010690	" PIPE 15"" ads"	\$ 5.75	NO BID	\$ 7.98	\$7.50
7010700	" PIPE 18"" ads"	\$ 7.85	NO BID	\$ 11.22	\$10.21
7010710	" PIPE 24"" ads"	\$ 12.70	NO BID	\$ 17.57	\$15.95
7010720	" PIPE 30"" ads"	\$ 20.40	NO BID	\$ 28.24	\$31.00

Bid 09-12 INT: \_\_\_\_\_ Vendor Name: \_\_\_\_\_